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In the songs and bubble feeding of humpback whales; in young killer whales learning to knock a seal from
an ice floe in the same way their mother does; and in the use of sea sponges by the dolphins of Shark Bay,
Australia, to protect their beaks while foraging for fish, we find clear examples of the transmission of
information among cetaceans. Just as human cultures pass on languages and turns of phrase, tastes in food
(and in how it is acquired), and modes of dress, could whales and dolphins have developed a culture of their
very own?

Unequivocally: yes. In The Cultural Lives of Whales and Dolphins, cetacean biologists Hal Whitehead, who
has spent much of his life on the ocean trying to understand whales, and Luke Rendell, whose research
focuses on the evolution of social learning, open an astounding porthole onto the fascinating culture beneath
the waves. As Whitehead and Rendell show, cetacean culture and its transmission are shaped by a blend of
adaptations, innate sociality, and the unique environment in which whales and dolphins live: a watery world
in which a hundred-and-fifty-ton blue whale can move with utter grace, and where the vertical expanse is as
vital, and almost as vast, as the horizontal.

Drawing on their own research as well as a scientific literature as immense as the sea—including
evolutionary biology, animal behavior, ecology, anthropology, psychology, and neuroscience—Whitehead
and Rendell dive into realms both humbling and enlightening as they seek to define what cetacean culture is,
why it exists, and what it means for the future of whales and dolphins. And, ultimately, what it means for our
future, as well.
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From reader reviews:

Craig Baker:

Within other case, little men and women like to read book The Cultural Lives of Whales and Dolphins. You
can choose the best book if you like reading a book. Providing we know about how is important the book
The Cultural Lives of Whales and Dolphins. You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world
by a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can understand everything! From your country
right up until foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you can know
that. In this era, we are able to open a book as well as searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You
can use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's learn.

Heather Reader:

The reason why? Because this The Cultural Lives of Whales and Dolphins is an unordinary book that the
inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will distress you with the secret this inside.
Reading this book close to it was fantastic author who also write the book in such remarkable way makes the
content inside of easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey the meaning completely. So , it
is good for you because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This phenomenal
book will give you a lot of benefits than the other book include such as help improving your skill and your
critical thinking approach. So , still want to delay having that book? If I have been you I will go to the
reserve store hurriedly.

Marlys Wieland:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you may have it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. That The Cultural Lives of Whales and Dolphins can give you a
lot of buddies because by you investigating this one book you have matter that they don't and make a person
more like an interesting person. That book can be one of one step for you to get success. This guide offer you
information that might be your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than different make you to be great
people. So , why hesitate? We need to have The Cultural Lives of Whales and Dolphins.

Lester Gibbons:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is prepared or printed or illustrated from each source this filled update of
news. Within this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for you. From
media social similar to newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your
book? Or just seeking the The Cultural Lives of Whales and Dolphins when you needed it?
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